

**Kemp Mill Elementary School  
Full Roof Replacement**

	<b>Citiroof Corp.</b>	<b>Cole Roofing Co., Inc.</b>	<b>Function Enterprises, Inc.</b>	<b>Interstate Corporation</b>	<b>Kalkreuth Roofing &amp; Sheet Metal, Inc.</b>	<b>Orndorff &amp; Spaid, Inc.</b>	<b>R.D. Bean, Inc.</b>	<b>Rayco Roof Srvce, Inc.</b>	<b>Tecta America</b>	<b>Vatica Contracting, Inc.</b>
<b>Base Bid</b>	\$ 1,169,900	\$ 1,903,300	NO BID	\$ 1,100,000	NO BID	\$ 1,323,147	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,733,000
<b>Lightweight Concrete</b>	\$ 30.00	\$ 28.50		\$ 35.00		\$ 32.00				\$ 30.00
<b>Metal Deck</b>	\$ 10.00	\$ 9.75		\$ 20.00		\$ 10.00				\$ 12.00
<b>Wood Deck</b>	\$ 8.50	\$ 7.50		\$ 20.00		\$ 9.00				\$ 10.00
<b>Tectum Deck</b>	\$ 35.00	\$ 26.50		\$ 40.00		\$ 32.00				\$ 32.00
<b>Bid Bond</b>	X	X		X		X				X
<b>MBE</b>	X	X		X		X				X
<b>Addendum #</b>	X	X		X		X				X