

**Flower Valley Elementary School
Full Roof Replacement**

**December 18, 2019
2:00 PM**

	Citiroof Corporation	Cole Roofing Co., Inc.	Function Enterprises, Inc.	Interstate Corporation	Kalkreuth Roofing & Sheet Metal	Orndorff & Spaid, Inc	R.D. Bean, Inc.	Rayco Roof Service, Inc.	Tecta America	Vatica Contracting, Inc.
Base Bid	\$ 1,560,300	\$ 2,693,000	NO BID	\$ 1,650,000	NO BID	\$ 2,234,425	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,475,000
Lightweight Concrete	\$ 30.00	\$ 28.50		\$ 35.00		\$ 30.00				\$ 25.00
Metal Deck	\$ 10.00	\$ 9.75		\$ 20.00		\$ 10.00				\$ 8.00
Wood Deck	\$ 8.50	\$ 7.50		\$ 20.00		\$ 9.00				\$ 7.00
Tectum Deck	\$ 35.00	\$ 26.50		\$ 40.00		\$ 30.00				\$ 25.00
Bid Bond	X	X		X		X				X
MBE	X	X		X		X				X
Addendum #	X	X		X		X				X