
JK Architects Fox Chapel Elementary School Addition October 6, 2009
4:00 pm

BIDDER
Dustin 

Construction, 
Inc.

GFG Builders. 
Inc.

Henley 
Construction 

Company, Inc.

John W. 
Brawner 

Contracting 
Co., Inc.

Keller Brothers, 
Inc

Maggin 
Construction 

Company, Inc.

R. J. Crowley, 
Inc.

Roy Kirby & 
Sons, Inc.

MBE Forms A & B X X X X X X No Bid X

Base Bid $4,587,000.00 $4,880,000.00 $4,448,000.00 $5,126,300.00 $4,275,000.00 $5,505,000.00 $5,369,000.00
Alt 1: Linkage to Learning 
Addition $180,000.00 $210,000.00 $190,000.00 $247,500.00 $190,000.00 $208,000.00 $260,000.00
Alt 2: New canopy at existing 
building front entrance $66,000.00 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $69,100.00 $64,600.00 $68,000.00 $71,000.00
Alt 3: Ceramic tiles at all walls 
of new toilet rooms $13,000.00 $32,000.00 $8,900.00 $14,450.00 $8,400.00 $8,000.00 $14,000.00
Alt 4: Replace finishes in two 
existing basement interior 
classrooms $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $55,000.00 $14,700.00 $8,600.00 $24,000.00 $69,000.00
Alt 5: Provide paving and grass 
ground cover at courtyard as 
indicated in drawings $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,950.00 $9,400.00 $10,000.00 $14,000.00
Alt 6: Existing building HVAC 
upgrade $497,000.00 $350,000.00 $39,000.00 $452,700.00 $475,000.00 $400,000.00 $640,000.00

Alt 7: Sprinkler existing building
$110,000.00 $106,000.00 $108,000.00 $128,700.00 $95,000.00 $172,000.00 $130,000.00

Total $5,471,000 $5,679,000 $4,931,900 $6,069,400 $5,126,000 $6,395,000 $0 $6,567,000
Bid Bond Included x x x x x x x
Addenda acknowledged-(1-5 ) x x x x x x x



JK Architects Fox Chapel Elementary School Addition October 6, 2009
4:00 pm

BIDDER

MBE Forms A & B

Base Bid 

Alt 1: Linkage to Learning 
Addition
Alt 2: New canopy at existing 
building front entrance
Alt 3: Ceramic tiles at all walls 
of new toilet rooms
Alt 4: Replace finishes in two 
existing basement interior 
classrooms
Alt 5: Provide paving and grass 
ground cover at courtyard as 
indicated in drawings
Alt 6: Existing building HVAC 
upgrade

Alt 7: Sprinkler existing building

Total

Bid Bond Included
Addenda acknowledged-(1-5 )

Scheibel 
Construction

Sumter 
Contracting 

Corp.

Smith & Haines, 
Inc.

Towson 
Mechanical, 

Inc.

Tuckman-
Barbee 

Construction 
Co., Inc.

The Whiting-
Turner 

Contracting 
Company

William F. 
Klingensmith, 

Inc.

X No Bid No Bid X X No Bid No Bid

$4,660,000.00 $5,030,000.00 $4,466,000.00

$194,000.00 $200,000.00 $215,000.00

$67,000.00 $18,300.00 $67,500.00

$9,000.00 $10,600.00 $9,600.00

$12,000.00 $13,735.00 $14,000.00

$10,000.00 $15,800.00 $9,500.00

$505,000.00 $520,000.00 $526,000.00

$185,000.00 $171,400.00 $267,000.00

$5,642,000 $0 $0 $5,979,835 $5,574,600 $0 $0
x x x
x x x


